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Through online integrated management

and clear coordination
between HR and other divisions much of

unsaid troubles could be mitigated. Now our
HR professionals can foresee a progressive
future in redefining HR intelligence. Here
lay the analysis to identify explorable skills

in existing employees and to deploy them in
the appropriate positions for which they
have been hired. This is the prescription for
cost cuts, to boost performers, motivate and
retain them. Whatever be the advancement,
the so called human factors still remain a
mystery and cannot be gauged through any
profiling tests.

The 'sukshuma' behind the understand-
ing of the human psychology is still a puz-

zle. The HR profes-
sionals also fall in
this category with-

out exemption. They travel miles to set the
ball rolling as long as they find it interest-
ing. The mentality of the quitting employ-
ees happens to be contagious that they (HR)
themselves are caught in the quick sand
but appreciably resist from falling sick and
emerge like a 'phoenix'. Recruiters can only
supply manpower and the satisfaction that
a new employee derives in his work purely
rests in the hands of his or her Group men-
tor. In every company HR builds up a
healthy atmosphere but cannot always
detect and eradicate the latent politics

which are the ubiquitous characteristics of
human beings. Are we heading in the right
way? Being proactive in salary and com-
pensation alone is not the solution to

employee turnover but there is something
else beyond. What is there behind the
industry trends of boom - bubble -crash -
survival -recovery - growth map? Perhaps it
is the human satisfaction that matters.
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